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APPLICATIONS INVITED FOR APPOINTMENT OF 
VOLUNTEERS FOR ORGANISING “NATIONAL ESSAY 
WRITING COMPETITION ON „STUDENT DEVELOPMENT 
UNDER THE LEADERSHIP OF NARENDRA MODI AS 
CHIEF MINISTER OF GUJARAT AND PRIME MINISTER 
OF INDIA” UPTO 15.02.2022 
 
 

With a purpose to develop writing skills amongst students of 
all classes, National Citizens’ Committee has launched 
National Essay Writing Competition on “Student 
Development under the leadership of Narendra Modi as 
Chief Minister of Gujarat and Prime Minister of India”. upto 
15.02.2022 to commemorate the completion of two decades 
of governance of Mr. Narendra Modi in his roles as Chief 
Minister of Gujarat and Prime Minister of India. 
 

In a signed message for the launch of this Competition, the 
Vice-President of India M. Venkaiah Naidu lauded this 
initiative of National Citizens Committee, and said that Prime 
Minister “Modi is keen about unleashing the potential of 
Young India of which students are an integral part”.  
 

“Shri Narendra Modi’s long tenure in office is marked by a 
clear vision for Gujarat and for our Country based on 
identified potential backed by a clear strategy of action and 
its execution with unprecedented energy and dynamism”, 
Vice-President further added in the message.  
 

We are inviting Indian students to participate in this online 
essay writing competition on the following Link: 
https://bit.ly/nccessay  by contributing Essay in 600 words in 
any language out of 13 Indian languages including Hindi, 
English, Urdu, Assamese, Bengali, Gujarati, Kannada, 
Malayalam, Marathi, Oriya, Punjabi, Tamil or Telugu on or 
before 15.02.2022.  
 

There are 4 categories including (1) School students of up to 
5th grade (2) School students from 6th grade to 8th grade (3) 
School students from 9th grade to 12th grade and (4) 
Graduate / Post-graduate College students. 
 

We are expecting a very large number of students to 
participate in this online essay competition, and this event is 
likely to be recorded in the Jurists Book of World Records. 
 

https://bit.ly/nccessay
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There will be Prizes for the top entries (in each language 
and each category of 1st Prize of Rs. 25,000/-, 2nd Prize of 
Rs. 20,000/- and 3rd Prize of Rs. 15,000/-. Hence there will 
be 52 participants who will get 1st Prize; 52 participants who 
will get 2nd Prize and 52 participants who will get 3rd Prize on 
merit basis in this Competition. 1st prize winners in each 
category will be considered for telecast of video recorded 
essay narrations on national television channels. 
 

We have also decided to select 3 participants from each of 
the 13 languages and each 4 categories by way of “Spin the 
Wheel” to give them individual surprise gifts as a token of 
appreciation. Therefore a total of 156 participants will get 
surprise gifts by way of “Spin the Wheel”. 
 

Every participant will be provided E-Certificate for 
contributing essays in the Competition. 
 

The Principals of the institutions with participation of over 50 
percent students will be felicitated. 15 Heads of Education 
Boards with high percentage of participation will also be 
honoured.  
 

Volunteers are required to contact the heads of universities, 
colleges, and schools in their respective allotted areas and 
will be required to ensure maximum participation of students 
in this Competition. 
 

Volunteers will be felicitated and will be provided E-
Certificate for their contribution in making the Competition a 
grand success. 
 

                             
                            (Dr. Adish C Aggarwala) 

Chairman 
 National Citizens’ Committee 

Mobiles : 9958177904, 9868510674 


